
VOLVO A25E 73007 - REAR RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCE229285
Oil Type: SAE 85W140
Job No:

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT INC (STE- FOY)175, rue de RotterdamSt-Augustin-de-Desmaures, QCCA  G3A 2K2Contact: Michel Lepagemlepage@strongco.comT: (418)870-1700F: (418)870-1701
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Elemental level of silicon(Si) above normal indicating ingressof seal material. The condition of theoil is acceptable for the time inservice.

Depot: VOLVO0228Unique No: 6432110Signed: Elizabeth ValachovicReport Date: 05 Nov 2013
Report Id: VOLVO0228 [WUSCAR] 03389338 (Generated: 09/28/2023 08:24:57) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Michel Lepage - VOLVO0228

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCE229285 VCE229294 VCE169984 VCE110111Sample Date 11 Oct 2013 10 Oct 2013 07 Jun 2012 25 Feb 2011Machine Hours 6738 6738 4613 2191Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 220.0 276.0 324.9 96.29
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 79 38 116 6Sodium ppm <1 1 2 3Potassium ppm 2 2 8 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 306 230 316 425Copper ppm 28 25 30 35Lead ppm <1 <1 0 <1Tin ppm <1 1 0 1Aluminum ppm 8 3 20 <1Chromium ppm 3 2 4 8Molybdenum ppm 0 0 <1 0Nickel ppm 2 2 4 5Titanium ppm <1 <1 2 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 3 2 4 11Vanadium ppm <1 <1 0 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 9 8 32 24Magnesium ppm 7 8 42 937Zinc ppm 8 7 33 17Phosphorus ppm 621 712 403 1606Barium ppm 0 0 0 <1Boron ppm 116 159 45 491

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0228 [WUSCAR] 03389338 (Generated: 09/28/2023 08:25:00) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Michel Lepage - VOLVO0228
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A25E 73007\Rear Right Final Drive [VCE229285] 11 Oct 2013 @ 6738.0 hrs

