
VOLVO A25E 73007 - BOGIE/CENTER LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCE160295
Oil Type: SAE 85W140
Job No:

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT INC (STE- FOY)175, rue de RotterdamSt-Augustin-de-Desmaures, QCCA  G3A 2K2Contact: Michel Lepagemlepage@strongco.comT: (418)870-1700F: (418)870-1701
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Theoil change at the time of samplinghas been noted. We recommend anearly resample to monitor thiscondition.Moderate concentration ofvisible metal present. Bearing and/orgear wear is indicated. Elementallevels of silicon (Si) and aluminum(Al) indicate alumina-silicate (coarsedirt) ingress. The condition of the oilis acceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0228Unique No: 6432115Signed: Elizabeth ValachovicReport Date: 05 Nov 2013
Report Id: VOLVO0228 [WUSCAR] 03389343 (Generated: 09/28/2023 08:24:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Michel Lepage - VOLVO0228

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCE160295 VCE169973 VCE110084 ---Sample Date 11 Oct 2013 07 Jun 2012 25 Feb 2011 ---Machine Hours 6738 4613 2191 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ---Sample Status SEVERE SEVERE ABNORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 332.5 333.7 96.24 ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 340 537 11 ---Sodium ppm 5 8 2 ---Potassium ppm 8 18 1 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 992 658 400 ---Copper ppm 216 146 44 ---Lead ppm <1 0 <1 ---Tin ppm 12 0 3 ---Aluminum ppm 39 79 1 ---Chromium ppm 11 7 7 ---Molybdenum ppm 0 0 0 ---Nickel ppm 10 8 6 ---Titanium ppm 4 5 2 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm 9 7 11 ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 <1 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 9 26 28 ---Magnesium ppm 11 76 799 ---Zinc ppm 18 41 20 ---Phosphorus ppm 797 404 1439 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 175 66 405 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0228 [WUSCAR] 03389343 (Generated: 09/28/2023 08:24:20) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Michel Lepage - VOLVO0228
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A25E 73007\Bogie/Center Left Final Drive [VCE160295] 11 Oct 2013 @ 6738.0 hrs

