
VOLVO ECR235CL 110174 - REAR LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VC462249
Oil Type: CASTROL OUTBOARD GEAR OIL EP 90
Job No:

DAYTON CONSTRUCTION146 BUNKER HILL ROADWATERTOWN, CTUS  06795Contact: SERVICE MANAGER
T: (860)274-2998F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Highconcentration of visible metalpresent. Gear wear is indicated.Elemental levels of silicon (Si) andaluminum (Al) indicate alumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: DAYWATUnique No: 6870847Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 08 Jan 2015
Report Id: DAYWAT [WUSCAR] 03657861 (Generated: 07/06/2023 09:31:15) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER - DAYWAT

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VC462249 --- --- ---Sample Date 27 Oct 2014 --- --- ---Machine Hours 3624 --- --- ---Oil Hours 582 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 77.94 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 196 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 14 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 15 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 614 --- --- ---Copper ppm 2 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 42 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 10 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 3 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 6 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1941 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 11 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 829 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 811 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 22 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: DAYWAT [WUSCAR] 03657861 (Generated: 07/06/2023 09:31:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER - DAYWAT
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO ECR235CL 110174\Rear Left Final Drive [VC462249] 27 Oct 2014 @ 3624.0 hrs

