
[[HURST EXC]] VOLVO EC340D 210404 - DIESEL FUEL

Sample No: VCP04569241
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: HURST EXC

HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT & SUPPLY CO MAINPO BOX 1957HARRISBURG, PAUS  17105Contact: CHAD HERRON
T: 7(175)643-3031F: (717)564-3568
Diagnosis
This is a baseline read-out on thesubmitted sample. There is noindication of any contamination inthe fuel.

Depot: VOLVO0025Unique No: 8358148Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 14 Oct 2018
Report Id: VOLVO0025 [WUSCAR] 04569241 (Generated: 07/12/2023 12:53:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHAD HERRON - VOLVO0025

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP04569241 --- --- ---Sample Date 08 Oct 2018 --- --- ---Machine Hours 3598 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 FUEL CONDITIONSulfur ppm 23 --- --- ---Visc @ 40°C cSt 2.49 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.004 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silicon ppm <1 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0025 [WUSCAR] 04569241 (Generated: 07/12/2023 12:53:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHAD HERRON - VOLVO0025
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC340D 210404\Diesel Fuel [VCP04569241] 08 Oct 2018 @ 3598.0 hrs

