
[[HURST EXC]] VOLVO EC340D 210404 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP220786
Oil Type: VOLVO COOLANT VCS (YELLOW)
Job No: HURST EXC

HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT & SUPPLY CO MAINPO BOX 1957HARRISBURG, PAUS  17105Contact: CHAD HERRON
T: 7(175)643-3031F: (717)564-3568
Diagnosis
The fluid is suitable for furtherservice. There is no indication of anycontamination in the component. Thecarboxylate level of this fluid isacceptable. The pH level of this fluidis within the acceptable limits. Theglycol level is acceptable.

Depot: VOLVO0025Unique No: 8358171Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 12 Oct 2018
Report Id: VOLVO0025 [WUSCAR] 04569264 (Generated: 07/12/2023 12:53:15) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHAD HERRON - VOLVO0025

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP220786 VCP168826 --- ---Sample Date 08 Oct 2018 08 Jan 2016 --- ---Machine Hours 3598 1100 --- ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 7.63 7.50 --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 0 0 --- ---Percentage Glycol % 48 49 --- ---Freezing Point °C -33 -26 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance normal normal --- ---Coolant Color Yllow Yllow --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0025 [WUSCAR] 04569264 (Generated: 07/12/2023 12:53:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHAD HERRON - VOLVO0025
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC340D 210404\Coolant [VCP220786] 08 Oct 2018 @ 3598.0 hrs

