
[[W121275 SENECA STONE]] VOLVO EC460B 11065 - RIGHT SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP214337
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90 GL-5
Job No: W121275 SENECA STONE

ALTA EQUIPMENT5985 COURT STREET ROADSYRACUSE, NYUS  13206Contact: TOM JOYCEtom.joyce@vanquip.comT: (315)437-2611F: (315)434-9471
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0142Unique No: 8484587Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 05 Feb 2019
Report Id: VOLVO0142 [WUSCAR] 04643151 (Generated: 11/17/2023 10:13:06) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TOM JOYCE - VOLVO0142

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP214337 VCP213585 VCP205212 ---Sample Date 25 Jan 2019 30 Jan 2018 24 Jan 2017 ---Machine Hours 9210 8939 12083 ---Oil Hours 750 2000 0 ---Oil Changed N/A Not Changd Not Changd ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 137.0 124.6 178.6 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.107 --- 0.846 ---Silicon ppm 7 6 14 ---Sodium ppm 3 5 1 ---Potassium ppm <1 1 2 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 90 278 453 ---Copper ppm 9 9 18 ---Lead ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Tin ppm <1 <1 0 ---Aluminum ppm <1 <1 2 ---Chromium ppm <1 2 4 ---Molybdenum ppm <1 0 0 ---Nickel ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm 1 2 4 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 430 23 24 ---Magnesium ppm 5 2 <1 ---Zinc ppm 181 31 22 ---Phosphorus ppm 825 881 937 ---Barium ppm 0 0 <1 ---Boron ppm 152 186 222 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0142 [WUSCAR] 04643151 (Generated: 11/17/2023 10:13:08) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TOM JOYCE - VOLVO0142
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC460B 11065\Right Swing Drive [VCP214337] 25 Jan 2019 @ 9210.0 hrs

