
[[A58028]] VOLVO 3153 - DIESEL FUEL

Sample No: VCP247484
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No: A58028

CHADWICK-BAROSS INC MAINPO BOX 4500WESTBROOK, MEUS  04098Contact: TODD PIERCEpierce@chadwick-baross.comT: (207)854-8411F: (207)854-8237
Diagnosis
This is a baseline read-out on thesubmitted sample.All metal levels arenormal indicating no corrosion in thesystem. The water content isnegligible. There is no indication ofany contamination in the fuel. Thecondition of the fuel appearsacceptable for service.

Depot: VOLVO0006Unique No: 8613664Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 30 May 2019
Report Id: VOLVO0006 [WUSCAR] 04721890 (Generated: 01/24/2024 09:54:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TODD PIERCE - VOLVO0006

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP247484 --- --- ---Sample Date 23 May 2019 --- --- ---Machine Hours 5463 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 FUEL CONDITIONSulfur ppm 0 --- --- ---Visc @ 40°C cSt 2.7 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.004 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 1 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0006 [WUSCAR] 04721890 (Generated: 01/24/2024 09:54:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TODD PIERCE - VOLVO0006
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO 3153\Diesel Fuel [VCP247484] 23 May 2019 @ 5463.0 hrs

