
[[GBW601 IAA UNIT1]] VOLVO L90H 624060 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP245043
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: GBW601 IAA UNIT1

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY4323 EAST WINSLOW AVENUEPHOENIX, AZUS  85040Contact: RANDY PRZEKURATrandyp@arnoldmachinery.comT: F: (602)414-1904
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. Please specify the brand,type, and viscosity of the oil on yournext sample.All component wearrates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO6174Unique No: 8653841Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 03 Jul 2019
Report Id: VOLVO6174 [WUSCAR] 04746128 (Generated: 09/20/2023 11:27:57) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY PRZEKURAT - VOLVO6174

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP245043 VCP226548 VCP226132 VCP230368Sample Date 25 Jun 2019 11 Jan 2019 13 Oct 2018 11 May 2018Machine Hours 4478 3227 0 1724Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed N/A N/ASample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 40.19 40.7 105.3 40.65
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 17 14 13 11Sodium ppm 7 2 2 3Potassium ppm <1 2 3 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 20 114 83 85Copper ppm 3 27 20 53Lead ppm <1 0 <1 <1Tin ppm 0 0 1 2Aluminum ppm 1 2 2 <1Chromium ppm <1 2 2 2Molybdenum ppm 0 0 <1 0Nickel ppm <1 2 <1 1Titanium ppm 0 1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 2 2 3Vanadium ppm 0 0 <1 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3919 4302 4349 3974Magnesium ppm 16 15 13 13Zinc ppm 1503 1625 1658 1586Phosphorus ppm 1279 1229 1352 1301Barium ppm 0 <1 0 0Boron ppm 113 115 118 109

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO6174 [WUSCAR] 04746128 (Generated: 09/20/2023 11:28:00) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY PRZEKURAT - VOLVO6174
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 624060\Rear Axle [VCP245043] 25 Jun 2019 @ 4478.0 hrs

