
[[GBV600 IAA UNIT1]] VOLVO L90H 624060 - TRANSMISSION

Sample No: VCP245015
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: GBV600 IAA UNIT1

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY4323 EAST WINSLOW AVENUEPHOENIX, AZUS  85040Contact: RANDY PRZEKURATrandyp@arnoldmachinery.comT: F: (602)414-1904
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.Gear wear is indicated. Thereis no indication of any contaminationin the fluid. The condition of the fluidis acceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO6174Unique No: 8653899Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 02 Jul 2019
Report Id: VOLVO6174 [WUSCAR] 04746186 (Generated: 09/20/2023 11:27:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY PRZEKURAT - VOLVO6174

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP245015 VCP226131 --- ---Sample Date 25 Jun 2019 13 Oct 2018 --- ---Machine Hours 4478 2717 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed N/A --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 26.1 257.7 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 13 14 --- ---Sodium ppm 10 9 --- ---Potassium ppm 8 3 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 150 143 --- ---Copper ppm 13 12 --- ---Lead ppm 0 2 --- ---Tin ppm 2 <1 --- ---Aluminum ppm 6 4 --- ---Chromium ppm 1 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 0 --- ---Nickel ppm <1 <1 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 11 12 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 187 222 --- ---Magnesium ppm 6 6 --- ---Zinc ppm 88 99 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 158 209 --- ---Barium ppm 4 4 --- ---Boron ppm 30 40 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO6174 [WUSCAR] 04746186 (Generated: 09/20/2023 11:27:35) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY PRZEKURAT - VOLVO6174
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 624060\Transmission [VCP245015] 25 Jun 2019 @ 4478.0 hrs

