
VOLVO L110H 631301 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP274915
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No:

COVANTA350 FLAKENBURG ROADTAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: SERVICE MANAGER
T: (813)684-5688F: 
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Gear wear isindicated. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: COVTAMUnique No: 9024609Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 12 May 2020
Report Id: COVTAM [WUSCAR] 04974467 (Generated: 09/07/2023 10:30:56) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER ? - COVTAM

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP274915 --- --- ---Sample Date 03 May 2020 --- --- ---Machine Hours 11442 --- --- ---Oil Hours 2000 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 41.2 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 24 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 5 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 1033 --- --- ---Copper ppm 2 --- --- ---Lead ppm 1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 19 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 14 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 5 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 26 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 5307 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 14 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 2087 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1751 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 142 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: COVTAM [WUSCAR] 04974467 (Generated: 09/07/2023 10:30:59) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER ? - COVTAM
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L110H 631301\Front Axle [VCP274915] 03 May 2020 @ 11442.0 hrs

