
VOLVO L110H 631301 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP274970
Oil Type: VOLVO COOLANT VCS (YELLOW)
Job No:

COVANTA350 FLAKENBURG ROADTAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: SERVICE MANAGER
T: (813)684-5688F: 
Diagnosis
The fluid is suitable for furtherservice. There is no indication of anycontamination in the coolant. Thecarboxylate level of this fluid isacceptable. The glycol level isacceptable. The pH level of this fluidis within the acceptable limits.

Depot: COVTAMUnique No: 9025312Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 14 May 2020
Report Id: COVTAM [WUSCAR] 04975170 (Generated: 09/07/2023 10:30:40) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER ? - COVTAM

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP274970 --- --- ---Sample Date 03 May 2020 --- --- ---Machine Hours 11442 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 7.96 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 0 --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 50 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -38 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance normal --- --- ---Coolant Color Yllow --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: COVTAM [WUSCAR] 04975170 (Generated: 09/07/2023 10:30:43) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER ? - COVTAM
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L110H 631301\Coolant [VCP274970] 03 May 2020 @ 11442.0 hrs

