
[[W214403]] VOLVO L110H 10365 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP267814
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: W214403

ULSTER COUNTY RESOURCE RECOVERY AGENCY999 FLATBUSH AVEKINGSTON, NYUS  12401Contact: CHARLES WHITTAKERcwhf@ucrra.netT: (845)399-2686F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: ULSKINUnique No: 9150428Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 25 Aug 2020
Report Id: ULSKIN [WUSCAR] 05050248 (Generated: 02/08/2024 13:09:53) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHARLES WHITTAKER - ULSKIN

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP267814 VCP294991 VC069271 VCP232685Sample Date 23 Jul 2020 31 Jan 2020 05 Dec 2019 05 Nov 2018Machine Hours 9102 10272 8109 7016Oil Hours 1000 2000 8109 800Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Changed Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 39.5 39.7 40.3 40.37
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 10 8 14 15Sodium ppm 4 1 2 1Potassium ppm 1 <1 <1 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 17 38 180 151Copper ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm 0 0 1 0Aluminum ppm 0 0 <1 <1Chromium ppm <1 <1 3 2Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 0 0Nickel ppm <1 0 <1 <1Titanium ppm <1 <1 0 <1Silver ppm 2 <1 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 4 3Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3863 4330 4480 4355Magnesium ppm 9 13 14 14Zinc ppm 1541 1635 1705 1749Phosphorus ppm 1273 1357 1487 1377Barium ppm 0 0 0 <1Boron ppm 252 130 130 123

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: ULSKIN [WUSCAR] 05050248 (Generated: 02/08/2024 13:09:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHARLES WHITTAKER - ULSKIN
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L110H 10365\Front Axle [VCP267814] 23 Jul 2020 @ 9102.0 hrs

