
[[W124640]] VOLVO EC460 11065 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP279715
Oil Type: VOLVO HYDRO
Job No: W124640

ALTA EQUIPMENT5985 COURT STREET ROADSYRACUSE, NYUS  13206Contact: JIM STRIGLEJIM.STRIGLE@ALTG.COMT: (315)437-2611F: (315)434-9471
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. The system cleanliness isacceptable for your target ISO 4406cleanliness code. The system andfluid cleanliness is acceptable. TheAN level is acceptable for this fluid.The condition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: VOLVO0142Unique No: 9205109Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 09 Oct 2020
Report Id: VOLVO0142 [WUSCAR] 05084873 (Generated: 03/11/2024 13:16:47) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM STRIGLE - VOLVO0142

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP279715 VCP265868 VCP214346 VCP213531Sample Date 29 Sep 2020 16 Dec 2019 25 Jan 2019 30 Jan 2018Machine Hours 14708 9900 9210 8939Oil Hours 0 0 750 2000Oil Changed N/A Not Changd Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 45.8 --- 46.48 47.54Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.411 --- 0.432 0.300
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGParticles >4µm 19901 --- 12033 22447Particles >6µm 4811 --- 1457 1551Particles >14µm 313 --- 84 104ISO 4406:1999 (c) 21/19/15 --- 21/18/14 22/18/14Silicon ppm 2 2 3 4Sodium ppm 0 <1 0 <1Potassium ppm <1 3 2 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 3 3 3 5Copper ppm 2 2 1 1Lead ppm <1 0 0 <1Tin ppm 0 0 0 0Aluminum ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 5 2 3 3Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm <1 <1 0 0Manganese ppm 0 0 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 215 231 232 256Magnesium ppm 30 9 12 16Zinc ppm 422 409 355 315Phosphorus ppm 346 335 304 291Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 5 6 5 4

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0142 [WUSCAR] 05084873 (Generated: 03/11/2024 13:16:51) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM STRIGLE - VOLVO0142
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC460 11065\Hydraulic System [VCP279715] 29 Sep 2020 @ 14708.0 hrs

