
[[W124716]] VOLVO EC480EL 310354 - SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP293300
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: W124716

SENECA MEADOWS1786 SALCMAN ROADWATERLOO, NYUS  Contact: EDWARD BARTOebarto@iesi.comT: (315)539-5624F: (315)539-4656
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: SENWATUnique No: 9218272Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 19 Oct 2020
Report Id: SENWAT [WUSCAR] 05093031 (Generated: 11/17/2023 09:50:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: EDWARD BARTO - SENWAT

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP293300 --- --- ---Sample Date 06 Oct 2020 --- --- ---Machine Hours 4515 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 61.5 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 6 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 63 --- --- ---Copper ppm 7 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 2 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 44 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 9 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 24 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1933 --- --- ---Barium ppm 1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 269 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SENWAT [WUSCAR] 05093031 (Generated: 11/17/2023 09:50:16) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: EDWARD BARTO - SENWAT
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC480EL 310354\Swing Drive [VCP293300] 06 Oct 2020 @ 4515.0 hrs

