
[[5586]] VOLVO EC460CL 110437 - LEFT SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP290605
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No: 5586

MCCLUNG-LOGAN EQUIPMENT CO - RICHMOND1345 MOUNTAIN ROADGLEN ALLEN, VAUS  23060Contact: KYLE RATLIFFEKRATLIFFE@MCCLUNG-LOGAN.COMT: F: (804)266-1611
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. The oil changeat the time of sampling has beennoted. Resample at the next serviceinterval to monitor.All componentwear rates are normal. Appearance ismilky. There is a light concentrationof water present in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO8882Unique No: 9313208Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 12 Jan 2021
Report Id: VOLVO8882 [WUSCAR] 05152928 (Generated: 03/05/2024 12:02:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KYLE RATLIFFE - VOLVO8882

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP290605 VCP171921 --- ---Sample Date 06 Jan 2021 15 Dec 2015 --- ---Machine Hours 6082 4194 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 335 287.7 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.216 0.882 --- ---Silicon ppm 13 28 --- ---Sodium ppm 3 2 --- ---Potassium ppm <1 0 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 260 312 --- ---Copper ppm 13 22 --- ---Lead ppm <1 <1 --- ---Tin ppm <1 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 6 --- ---Chromium ppm 3 4 --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 0 --- ---Nickel ppm <1 <1 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 1 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 3 4 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 25 39 --- ---Magnesium ppm 6 4 --- ---Zinc ppm 46 61 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 917 768 --- ---Barium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Boron ppm 128 82 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8882 [WUSCAR] 05152928 (Generated: 03/05/2024 12:02:51) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KYLE RATLIFFE - VOLVO8882
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC460CL 110437\Left Swing Drive [VCP290605] 06 Jan 2021 @ 6082.0 hrs

