
[[SWO-571169-20]] VOLVO L60H 622097 - TANK DIESEL FUEL

Sample No: VCP305337
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: SWO-571169-20

MAPLE RIDGE HARDWOODS2270 N DOBLER RDSTERLING, MIUS  48659Contact: STEVE BENDERmapleridge.shop@aol.comT: (989)873-8185F: 
Diagnosis
This is a baseline read-out on thesubmitted sample.All metal levels arenormal indicating no corrosion in thecooling system. The water content isnegligible. There is no indication ofany contamination in the fuel.

Depot: MAPSTEUnique No: 9406441Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 19 Mar 2021
Report Id: MAPSTE [WUSCAR] 05205032 (Generated: 12/05/2023 15:14:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEVE BENDER - MAPSTE

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP305337 --- --- ---Sample Date 10 Mar 2021 --- --- ---Machine Hours 3651 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 FUEL CONDITIONSulfur ppm 7 --- --- ---Visc @ 40°C cSt 3.09 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.002 --- --- ---Lead ppm 2 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm <1 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: MAPSTE [WUSCAR] 05205032 (Generated: 12/05/2023 15:14:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEVE BENDER - MAPSTE
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L60H 622097\Tank Diesel Fuel [VCP305337] 10 Mar 2021 @ 3651.0 hrs

