
[[X54469]] VOLVO EC250ELR 310694 - DIESEL FUEL

Sample No: VCP311649
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: X54469

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Saint RosePO BOX 997SAINT ROSE, LAUS  70087Contact: DANA FOSHEEdfoshee@scottcompanies.comT: (504)461-0961F: (504)461-0970
Diagnosis
This is a baseline read-out on thesubmitted sample. We recommendyou service the filters on thiscomponent. Appearance is hazy.Moderate concentration of visibledirt/debris present in the fuel. Thewater content is negligible.

Depot: SCOSAIUnique No: 9447690Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 02 Apr 2021
Report Id: SCOSAI [WUSCAR] 05218792 (Generated: 11/27/2023 09:27:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DANA FOSHEE - SCOSAI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP311649 --- --- ---Sample Date 29 Mar 2021 --- --- ---Machine Hours 995 --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 FUEL CONDITIONSulfur ppm 0 --- --- ---Visc @ 40°C cSt 2.42 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.004 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SCOSAI [WUSCAR] 05218792 (Generated: 11/27/2023 09:27:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DANA FOSHEE - SCOSAI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC250ELR 310694\Diesel Fuel [VCP311649] 29 Mar 2021 @ 995.0 hrs

