
[[SWO584210]] FUCHS MHL340F2 340410/5529 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP305630
Oil Type: AW HYDRAULIC OIL ISO 10
Job No: SWO584210

ALTA EQUIPMENT CO - ORLAND PARK5000 INDUSTRIAL HWYGARY, INUS  46406Contact: MARK DEROSAmark.derosa@altg.comT: (248)356-5200F: 
Diagnosis
We recommend you service the filterson this component. We advise thatyou inspect for the source(s) of metal.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. We were unable toperform a particle count due to metalparticles present in thissample.Moderate concentration ofvisible metal present. All componentwear rates are normal. There is a lightconcentration of water present in theoil. The AN level is acceptable for thisfluid.

Depot: VOLVO8885Unique No: 9454500Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 12 Apr 2021
Report Id: VOLVO8885 [WUSCAR] 05225602 (Generated: 03/11/2024 12:20:03) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARK DEROSA - VOLVO8885

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP305630 VCP279717 --- ---Sample Date 30 Mar 2021 17 Jul 2020 --- ---Machine Hours 3470 2006 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd Changed --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ATTENTION --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 44.8 44.0 --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.407 0.396 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.181 NEG --- ---Particles >4µm --- 7042 --- ---Particles >6µm --- 1625 --- ---Particles >14µm --- 138 --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) --- 20/18/14 --- ---Silicon ppm 3 5 --- ---Sodium ppm 2 <1 --- ---Potassium ppm 0 <1 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 5 15 --- ---Copper ppm 2 2 --- ---Lead ppm <1 <1 --- ---Tin ppm 0 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 <1 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 0 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 <1 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 0 --- ---Silver ppm <1 <1 --- ---Manganese ppm <1 <1 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 41 42 --- ---Magnesium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Zinc ppm 406 409 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 304 315 --- ---Barium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Boron ppm 4 <1 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8885 [WUSCAR] 05225602 (Generated: 03/11/2024 12:20:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARK DEROSA - VOLVO8885
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	FUCHS FUCHS MHL340F2 340410/5529\Hydraulic System [VCP305630] 30 Mar 2021 @ 3470.0 hrs

