
[[SWO598136]] JOHN DEERE 350G LC 1FF350GXKDE809571 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP306416
Oil Type: SAE 10W30
Job No: SWO598136

ACQUA CONTRACTORS551 S IL RTE 83ELMHURST, ILUS  60126Contact: ALEX RENDINAalex@acquacontractors.comT: (630)417-7881F: 
Diagnosis
Recommend drain oil if not alreadydone. Reduce drain interval to 2000hours or drain and flush and userecommended zinc free oil. Oil andfilter change at the time of samplinghas been noted. We were unable toperform a particle count due to ahigh concentration of particlespresent in this sample.All componentwear rates are normal. Moderateconcentration of visible dirt/debrispresent in the oil. Zinc level abovemanufacturer’s recommendations.The AN level is acceptable for thisfluid.

Depot: ACQELMUnique No: 9486107Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 03 May 2021
Report Id: ACQELM [WUSCAR] 05242198 (Generated: 07/16/2024 12:19:54) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ALEX RENDINA - ACQELM

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP306416 --- --- ---Sample Date 20 Apr 2021 --- --- ---Machine Hours 5356 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 44.9 --- --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.293 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 2 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 7 --- --- ---Copper ppm 1 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 219 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 4 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 150 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 513 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 3 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: ACQELM [WUSCAR] 05242198 (Generated: 07/16/2024 12:19:56) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ALEX RENDINA - ACQELM
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	JOHN DEERE JOHN DEERE 350G LC 1FF350GXKDE809571\Hydraulic System [VCP306416] 20 Apr 2021 @ 5356.0 hrs

