
[[SWO598136]] JOHN DEERE 350G LC 1FF350GXKDE809571 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP306413
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 15W40
Job No: SWO598136

ACQUA CONTRACTORS551 S IL RTE 83ELMHURST, ILUS  60126Contact: ALEX RENDINAalex@acquacontractors.comT: (630)417-7881F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: ACQELMUnique No: 9486403Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 03 May 2021
Report Id: ACQELM [WUSCAR] 05242494 (Generated: 07/16/2024 12:19:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ALEX RENDINA - ACQELM

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP306413 --- --- ---Sample Date 20 Apr 2021 --- --- ---Machine Hours 5356 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 14.1 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 72 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 0.8 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 88 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 65 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 5 --- --- ---Sodium ppm <1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 5 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 76 --- --- ---Copper ppm 2 --- --- ---Lead ppm 2 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 4 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 63 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 64 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1669 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 551 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1213 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1030 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 45 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: ACQELM [WUSCAR] 05242494 (Generated: 07/16/2024 12:19:50) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ALEX RENDINA - ACQELM
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	JOHN DEERE JOHN DEERE 350G LC 1FF350GXKDE809571\Diesel Engine [VCP306413] 20 Apr 2021 @ 5356.0 hrs

