
[[W215226]] VOLVO L60H 621480 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP303885
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: W215226

ULSTER COUNTY RESOURCE RECOVERY AGENCY999 FLATBUSH AVEKINGSTON, NYUS  12401Contact: CHARLES WHITTAKERcwhf@ucrra.netT: (845)399-2686F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The amountand size of particulates present in thesystem are acceptable. The oilviscosity is lower than normal. TheAN level is acceptable for this fluid.

Depot: ULSKINUnique No: 9514550Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 25 May 2021
Report Id: ULSKIN [WUSCAR] 05260627 (Generated: 02/08/2024 14:22:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHARLES WHITTAKER - ULSKIN

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP303885 VCP234085 VCP223823 ---Sample Date 15 Apr 2021 30 Oct 2019 26 Dec 2018 ---Machine Hours 2934 1992 1031 ---Oil Hours 2900 1992 1000 ---Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd ---Sample Status MARGINAL MARGINAL MARGINAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 36.7 36.8 37.66 ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.299 0.317 0.405 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG ---Particles >4µm 13228 6867 4167 ---Particles >6µm 943 753 427 ---Particles >14µm 36 50 26 ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 21/17/12 20/17/13 19/16/12 ---Silicon ppm 3 3 3 ---Sodium ppm 2 2 <1 ---Potassium ppm 2 1 3 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 3 3 2 ---Copper ppm 6 4 3 ---Lead ppm 2 2 0 ---Tin ppm <1 <1 0 ---Aluminum ppm <1 1 0 ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 0 ---Nickel ppm <1 <1 0 ---Titanium ppm <1 0 0 ---Silver ppm <1 0 0 ---Manganese ppm 0 0 0 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 523 505 96 ---Magnesium ppm 4 4 2 ---Zinc ppm 521 493 409 ---Phosphorus ppm 405 390 320 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 16 14 2 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: ULSKIN [WUSCAR] 05260627 (Generated: 02/08/2024 14:22:06) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHARLES WHITTAKER - ULSKIN
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L60H 621480\Hydraulic System [VCP303885] 15 Apr 2021 @ 2934.0 hrs

