
[[A05836]] VOLVO EC480E 310234 - REAR LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP310395
Oil Type: MOBIL MOBILUBE HD 85W140
Job No: A05836

K C CONSTRUCTION1737 STOUT DRIVEIVYLAND, PAUS  18974Contact: DUKE D.duked@kcconstruct.comT: (267)784-7337F:  x:
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Theoil change at the time of samplinghas been noted. We advise that youinspect for the source(s) of wear. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.The iron levelis severe. Gear wear is indicated.Elemental levels of silicon (Si) andaluminum (Al) indicate alumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress. The oilviscosity is higher than normal. Theoil is no longer serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: KCCIVYUnique No: 9514977Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 25 May 2021
Report Id: KCCIVY [WUSCAR] 05261054 (Generated: 08/23/2023 15:29:14) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DUKE D. - KCCIVY

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP310395 VCP220466 VCP205158 VCP180630Sample Date 18 May 2021 24 Jan 2019 05 May 2017 24 Sep 2016Machine Hours 4415 3870 2200 0Oil Hours 2000 1000 1000 1000Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Changed Not ChangdSample Status SEVERE SEVERE SEVERE ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 592 520.7 263.8 183.5
 CONTAMINATIONWater % --- 0.117 --- ---Silicon ppm 2335 3212 388 159Sodium ppm 32 58 13 2Potassium ppm 113 172 27 8
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 7616 9105 685 675Copper ppm 18 26 0 <1Lead ppm 2 0 0 <1Tin ppm 2 0 11 0Aluminum ppm 390 570 78 30Chromium ppm 55 68 7 9Molybdenum ppm 13 0 0 0Nickel ppm 5 5 <1 <1Titanium ppm 44 58 7 3Silver ppm <1 0 0 0Manganese ppm 52 67 7 7Vanadium ppm 1 2 <1 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 133 149 125 6Magnesium ppm 57 64 20 1Zinc ppm 69 86 64 9Phosphorus ppm 797 624 824 272Barium ppm 0 5 <1 6Boron ppm 164 82 116 2

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: KCCIVY [WUSCAR] 05261054 (Generated: 08/23/2023 15:29:18) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DUKE D. - KCCIVY
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC480E 310234\Rear Left Final Drive [VCP310395] 18 May 2021 @ 4415.0 hrs

