
[[W125703]] VOLVO EC380E 311723 - SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP303206
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90 GL-5
Job No: W125703

ALTA EQUIPMENT5985 COURT STREET ROADSYRACUSE, NYUS  13206Contact: JIM STRIGLEJIM.STRIGLE@ALTG.COMT: (315)437-2611F: (315)434-9471
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0142Unique No: 9516128Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 25 May 2021
Report Id: VOLVO0142 [WUSCAR] 05262205 (Generated: 07/10/2024 12:04:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM STRIGLE - VOLVO0142

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP303206 --- --- ---Sample Date 13 May 2021 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2298 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 237 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 7 --- --- ---Sodium ppm <1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 87 --- --- ---Copper ppm 7 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 5 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 161 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 39 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 103 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 855 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 161 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0142 [WUSCAR] 05262205 (Generated: 07/10/2024 12:04:40) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM STRIGLE - VOLVO0142
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC380E 311723\Swing Drive [VCP303206] 13 May 2021 @ 2298.0 hrs

