
[[642082 TUCKER PAVING]] VOLVO A25G 740257 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP310959
Oil Type: VOLVO COOLANT VCS (YELLOW)
Job No: 642082 TUCKER PAVING

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLC8418 PALM RIVER ROADTAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: KC BRASHERkc.brasher@altg.comT: (813)848-4095F: (813)630-2233
Diagnosis
We recommend drain system, andrefill with 50/50 antifreeze watermixture. There is no indication of anycontamination in the coolant. Theglycol level is lower than acceptable.The carboxylate level of this fluid isacceptable. The pH level of this fluidis within the acceptable limits.

Depot: VOLVO0093Unique No: 9591960Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 26 Jul 2021
Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 05307991 (Generated: 02/21/2024 15:35:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KC BRASHER - VOLVO0093

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP310959 --- --- ---Sample Date 25 Jun 2021 --- --- ---Machine Hours 6077 --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 7.49 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 0 --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 37 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -9 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance normal --- --- ---Coolant Color Orange --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 05307991 (Generated: 02/21/2024 15:36:00) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KC BRASHER - VOLVO0093
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A25G 740257\Coolant [VCP310959] 25 Jun 2021 @ 6077.0 hrs

