
[[W11862]] VOLVO A45G 352087 - WET DISC BRAKE

Sample No: VCP316967
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: W11862

HOUSBY HEAVY EQUIPMENT, LLC4410 SE 4 MILE DRANKENY, IAUS  50021Contact: Cody Shrevescsfreves@scottvankeppel.comT: (515)964-2762F: (515)964-2865
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.The iron level is abnormal.The copper level is abnormal.Moderate concentration of visiblemetal present. Elemental level ofsilicon (Si) above normal indicatingingress of seal material. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0080Unique No: 9592251Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 23 Jul 2021
Report Id: VOLVO0080 [WUSCAR] 05308282 (Generated: 08/17/2023 16:30:50) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Cody Shreves - VOLVO0080

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP316967 --- --- ---Sample Date 13 Jul 2021 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2296 --- --- ---Oil Hours 2000 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 39.9 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 23 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 9 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 52 --- --- ---Copper ppm 106 --- --- ---Lead ppm 2 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 4 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 2 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 4220 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 36 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1432 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1330 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 257 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0080 [WUSCAR] 05308282 (Generated: 08/17/2023 16:30:53) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Cody Shreves - VOLVO0080
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 352087\Wet Disc Brake [VCP316967] 13 Jul 2021 @ 2296.0 hrs

