
[[W215513]] VOLVO L220H 3193 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP321795
Oil Type: VOLVO COOLANT VCS (YELLOW)
Job No: W215513

CALLANANRT 32 677 FLATBUSH RDEAST KINGSTON, NYUS  12401Contact: 
T: F: 
Diagnosis
The fluid is suitable for furtherservice. There is no indication of anycontamination in the coolant. Thecarboxylate level of this fluid isacceptable. The glycol level isacceptable. The pH level of this fluidis within the acceptable limits.

Depot: CALEASUnique No: 9610464Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 09 Aug 2021
Report Id: CALEAS [WUSCAR] 05321494 (Generated: 07/17/2024 14:14:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ? ? - CALEAS

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP321795 VCP268666 VCP267652 ---Sample Date 21 Jul 2021 14 Jul 2020 22 May 2020 ---Machine Hours 4950 2646 2289 ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ---
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 7.14 7.26 7.26 ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 0 0 0 ---Percentage Glycol % 50 49 48 ---Freezing Point °C -38 -35 -34 ---
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance normal normal normal ---Coolant Color Yllow Yllow Yllow ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CALEAS [WUSCAR] 05321494 (Generated: 07/17/2024 14:14:57) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ? ? - CALEAS
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L220H 3193\Coolant [VCP321795] 21 Jul 2021 @ 4950.0 hrs

