
[[677204]] VOLVO EC350EL 310558 - REAR RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP320721
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: 677204

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER EQUIPMENT LLC9601 BOGGY CREEK RDORLANDO, FLUS  32824Contact: Robert LaPlanterobert.laplante@altg.comT: (407)508-9736F: (407)659-8720
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. Please specify the brand,type, and viscosity of the oil on yournext sample.Gear wear is indicated.Elemental levels of silicon (Si) andaluminum (Al) indicate alumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0096Unique No: 9623233Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 19 Aug 2021
Report Id: VOLVO0096 [WUSCAR] 05329236 (Generated: 07/25/2023 15:52:42) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Robert LaPlante - VOLVO0096

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP320721 --- --- ---Sample Date 11 Aug 2021 --- --- ---Machine Hours 3118 --- --- ---Oil Hours 1118 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 168 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 105 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 29 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 639 --- --- ---Copper ppm 1 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 14 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 16 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 13 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1197 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 46 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 17 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 479 --- --- ---Barium ppm 3 --- --- ---Boron ppm 2 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0096 [WUSCAR] 05329236 (Generated: 07/25/2023 15:52:45) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Robert LaPlante - VOLVO0096
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC350EL 310558\Rear Right Final Drive [VCP320721] 11 Aug 2021 @ 3118.0 hrs

