
[[127756]] VOLVO A60H 350019 - BRAKE

Sample No: VCP318529
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: 127756

ROMCO INC - AUSTIN BRANCH1150 WEST OLD SETTLERS BOULEVARDROUNDROCK, TXUS  78681Contact: MATT MACHANNmmachann@romco.comT: (832)270-0121F: (512)845-7565
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Bearingand/or bushing wear is indicated. Allother component wear rates arenormal. There is no indication of anycontamination in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0088Unique No: 9623261Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 19 Aug 2021
Report Id: VOLVO0088 [WUSCAR] 05329264 (Generated: 09/23/2023 13:46:14) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT MACHANN - VOLVO0088

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP318529 VCP294709 VCP271845 ---Sample Date 07 Aug 2021 03 Mar 2021 12 Oct 2020 ---Machine Hours 3377 2742 2146 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Changed ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 43.6 43.3 40.5 ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 27 22 35 ---Sodium ppm 4 5 6 ---Potassium ppm 1 0 16 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 65 47 43 ---Copper ppm 163 114 130 ---Lead ppm 1 2 0 ---Tin ppm 0 0 0 ---Aluminum ppm 0 2 <1 ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Molybdenum ppm 1 <1 <1 ---Nickel ppm 4 3 4 ---Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm 2 1 1 ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3999 3493 4216 ---Magnesium ppm 17 11 10 ---Zinc ppm 1440 1431 1675 ---Phosphorus ppm 1286 1173 1327 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 129 83 120 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0088 [WUSCAR] 05329264 (Generated: 09/23/2023 13:46:18) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT MACHANN - VOLVO0088
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A60H 350019\Brake [VCP318529] 07 Aug 2021 @ 3377.0 hrs

