
[[SWO733505 LEMONT]] FUCHS MHL340F2 340410/5529 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP320728
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 15W40
Job No: SWO733505 LEMONT

ALTA EQUIPMENT CO - ORLAND PARK5000 INDUSTRIAL HWYGARY, INUS  46406Contact: MARK DEROSAmark.derosa@altg.comT: (248)356-5200F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO8885Unique No: 9710034Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 25 Oct 2021
Report Id: VOLVO8885 [WUSCAR] 05380906 (Generated: 03/11/2024 12:19:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARK DEROSA - VOLVO8885

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP320728 VCP306076 VCP292349 VCP05027104Sample Date 11 Oct 2021 30 Mar 2021 17 Nov 2020 17 Jul 2020Machine Hours 4144 3470 2791 2006Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed N/A Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.8 13.48 12.8 12.7Oxidation (PA) % 74 80 77 77
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG 0.106Soot % % 0.8 1.1 0.8 0.7Nitration (PA) % 85 91 83 90Sulfation (PA) % 59 66 62 64Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 7 4 7 7Sodium ppm 3 2 0 2Potassium ppm 12 1 <1 6
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 22 28 27 30Copper ppm 9 6 10 10Lead ppm 2 <1 1 <1Tin ppm 0 1 2 0Aluminum ppm 21 26 14 16Chromium ppm 2 2 2 2Molybdenum ppm 67 80 80 68Nickel ppm <1 1 <1 2Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 <1 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1344 1213 1369 1256Magnesium ppm 1043 906 913 876Zinc ppm 1354 1201 1189 987Phosphorus ppm 1107 972 1032 852Barium ppm 0 <1 0 <1Boron ppm 12 62 38 35

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8885 [WUSCAR] 05380906 (Generated: 03/11/2024 12:19:52) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARK DEROSA - VOLVO8885
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	FUCHS FUCHS MHL340F2 340410/5529\Diesel Engine [VCP320728] 11 Oct 2021 @ 4144.0 hrs

