
[[RCA]] VOLVO L260H 1176 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP329742
Oil Type: VOLVO
Job No: RCA

Hoffman Equipment - Bronx1144 Zerega AvenueBronx, NYUS  10462Contact: BRANDON LOGANbrandon.logan@hoffmanequip.comT: (718)822-1180F: 
Diagnosis
We recommend that you drain the oilfrom the component if this has notalready been done. We advise thatyou inspect for the source(s) of wear.We recommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Gear wear isindicated. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The oilis no longer serviceable as a result ofthe abnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: HOFBROUnique No: 9811921Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 14 Jan 2022
Report Id: HOFBRO [WUSCAR] 05442727 (Generated: 06/27/2024 13:38:53) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRANDON LOGAN - HOFBRO

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP329742 --- --- ---Sample Date 22 Dec 2021 --- --- ---Machine Hours 3859 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 40.5 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 18 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 2103 --- --- ---Copper ppm 4 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 26 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 20 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 10 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 22 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3700 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 12 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1481 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1278 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 109 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: HOFBRO [WUSCAR] 05442727 (Generated: 06/27/2024 13:38:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRANDON LOGAN - HOFBRO
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L260H 1176\Rear Axle [VCP329742] 22 Dec 2021 @ 3859.0 hrs

