
[[GD5194]] VOLVO L90H 623884 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP320146
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: GD5194

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY4323 EAST WINSLOW AVENUEPHOENIX, AZUS  85040Contact: RANDY PRZEKURATrandyp@arnoldmachinery.comT: F: (602)414-1904
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Moderate concentrationof visible dirt/debris present in theoil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO6174Unique No: 9812703Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 14 Jan 2022
Report Id: VOLVO6174 [WUSCAR] 05443509 (Generated: 02/06/2024 08:41:36) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY PRZEKURAT - VOLVO6174

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP320146 VCP236892 VCP239062 VCP224306Sample Date 05 Jan 2022 27 Feb 2019 11 Feb 2019 13 Dec 2018Machine Hours 8798 4440 4361 4180Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed N/A Changed N/ASample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 41.2 40.7 40.45 40.11
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 14 14 16 16Sodium ppm 7 4 7 8Potassium ppm 0 12 12 16
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 28 26 50 38Copper ppm 10 2 7 5Lead ppm <1 0 1 <1Tin ppm 0 0 0 <1Aluminum ppm 2 2 2 3Chromium ppm <1 <1 2 2Molybdenum ppm 5 <1 2 1Nickel ppm 0 <1 0 <1Titanium ppm <1 1 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 1 2Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3545 4102 4082 4053Magnesium ppm 24 13 13 13Zinc ppm 1411 1580 1591 1532Phosphorus ppm 1169 1243 1194 1144Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 128 110 111 109

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO6174 [WUSCAR] 05443509 (Generated: 02/06/2024 08:41:38) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY PRZEKURAT - VOLVO6174
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 623884\Rear Axle [VCP320146] 05 Jan 2022 @ 8798.0 hrs

