
[[216445]] VOLVO L220H 3193 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP342776
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: 216445

CALLANANRT 32 677 FLATBUSH RDEAST KINGSTON, NYUS  12401Contact: 
T: F: 
Diagnosis
We recommend you service the filterson this component. Resample at thenext service interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is a high amount ofparticulates present in the oil. The ANlevel is acceptable for this fluid. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: CALEASUnique No: 9825507Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 26 Jan 2022
Report Id: CALEAS [WUSCAR] 05451312 (Generated: 07/17/2024 14:15:22) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ? ? - CALEAS

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP342776 VCP321792 VCP269175 VCP267656Sample Date 20 Jan 2022 22 Jul 2021 14 Jul 2020 22 May 2020Machine Hours 6018 4950 2646 2289Oil Hours 0 4950 2646 2289Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ATTENTION ATTENTION
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 39.9 37.4 37.6 37.71Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.35 0.331 0.389 0.380
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGParticles >4µm 63243 --- 2044 1447Particles >6µm 8421 --- 166 146Particles >14µm 375 --- 18 11ISO 4406:1999 (c) 23/20/16 --- 18/15/11 18/14/11Silicon ppm 4 4 3 0Sodium ppm 2 1 <1 0Potassium ppm 0 <1 <1 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 8 8 4 2Copper ppm 3 6 5 5Lead ppm <1 2 1 1Tin ppm <1 <1 0 <1Aluminum ppm 1 2 <1 0Chromium ppm 1 3 1 1Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 0 0Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm <1 0 0 <1Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 0Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 464 72 57 59Magnesium ppm 4 <1 <1 <1Zinc ppm 544 425 378 434Phosphorus ppm 424 325 315 343Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 17 2 1 1

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CALEAS [WUSCAR] 05451312 (Generated: 07/17/2024 14:15:25) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ? ? - CALEAS
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L220H 3193\Hydraulic System [VCP342776] 20 Jan 2022 @ 6018.0 hrs

