
[[356039 CEMEX IND]] VOLVO EC220EL 314441 - REAR LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP351122
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No: 356039 CEMEX IND

FREDERICK DERR AND COMPANYPO BOX 2719SARASOTA, FLUS  34230Contact: ROBERT TENNANTROBERT@FREDERICKDERRCOMPANY.COMT: (941)355-8575F: 
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.Gear wear is indicated. Thereis no indication of any contaminationin the oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: FRESARUnique No: 9869919Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 03 Mar 2022
Report Id: FRESAR [WUSCAR] 05480705 (Generated: 02/09/2024 13:18:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROBERT TENNANT - fresar

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP351122 --- --- ---Sample Date 24 Jan 2022 --- --- ---Machine Hours 734 --- --- ---Oil Hours 734 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 165 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 14 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 511 --- --- ---Copper ppm <1 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 7 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 7 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 6 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 0 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 4 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 216 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 3 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: FRESAR [WUSCAR] 05480705 (Generated: 02/09/2024 13:18:19) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROBERT TENNANT - fresar
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC220EL 314441\Rear Left Final Drive [VCP351122] 24 Jan 2022 @ 734.0 hrs

