
VOLVO EC160EL 310364 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP335945
Oil Type: CHEVRON DELO EXTENDED LIFE COOLANT
Job No:

DH FUNK AND SONS LLC3995 CONTINENTAL DRIVECOLUMBIA, PAUS  17512Contact: GARY SHEPHERDGSHEPHERD@DHFUNK.COMT: F: 
Diagnosis
The fluid is suitable for furtherservice. There is no indication of anycontamination in the coolant. Thecarboxylate level of this fluid isacceptable. The glycol level isacceptable. The pH level of this fluidis within the acceptable limits.

Depot: DHFCOLUnique No: 9917329Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 04 Apr 2022
Report Id: DHFCOL [WUSCAR] 05508055 (Generated: 08/10/2023 11:41:59) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: GARY SHEPHERD - DHFCOL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP335945 --- --- ---Sample Date 25 Mar 2022 --- --- ---Machine Hours 3000 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 7.71 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 0 --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 50.3 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -35 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance normal --- --- ---Coolant Color Orange --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: DHFCOL [WUSCAR] 05508055 (Generated: 08/10/2023 11:42:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: GARY SHEPHERD - DHFCOL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC160EL 310364\Coolant [VCP335945] 25 Mar 2022 @ 3000.0 hrs

