
VOLVO A30G 752518 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP361728
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 30
Job No:

ROMCO INC1350 NE LOOP 820FORT WORTH, TXUS  76106Contact: CHRIS BITNERCBitner@romco.comT: F: (817)626-8983
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Thecopper level is abnormal. All othermetal levels are typical for a newcomponent breaking in. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: VOLVO0081Unique No: 9917361Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 05 Apr 2022
Report Id: VOLVO0081 [WUSCAR] 05508087 (Generated: 09/08/2023 09:08:42) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHRIS BITNER - VOLVO0081

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP361728 --- --- ---Sample Date 16 Feb 2022 --- --- ---Machine Hours 482 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 11.82 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.8 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 67 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.2 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 60 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 58 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % 0.3 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 31 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 20 --- --- ---Copper ppm 75 --- --- ---Lead ppm 1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 2 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 42 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 2 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 3 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1899 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 295 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1074 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 974 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 114 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0081 [WUSCAR] 05508087 (Generated: 09/08/2023 09:08:45) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHRIS BITNER - VOLVO0081
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A30G 752518\Diesel Engine [VCP361728] 16 Feb 2022 @ 482.0 hrs

