
[[W127867]] VOLVO EC250EL 314145 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP359463
Oil Type: VOLVO
Job No: W127867

ALTA EQUIPMENT5985 COURT STREET ROADSYRACUSE, NYUS  13206Contact: JIM STRIGLEJIM.STRIGLE@ALTG.COMT: (315)437-2611F: (315)434-9471
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. We advise thatyou perform a filter service, and useoff-line filtration to improve thecleanliness of the system fluid. Elsewe recommend that you drain the oiland perform a filter service on thiscomponent if not already done. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition. There is toomuch water present in this sample toperform a particle count.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Appearance is milky. There is a highconcentration of water present in theoil. The AN level is acceptable for thisfluid.

Depot: VOLVO0142Unique No: 9929679Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 12 Apr 2022
Report Id: VOLVO0142 [WUSCAR] 05515400 (Generated: 08/05/2023 13:46:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM STRIGLE - VOLVO0142

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP359463 --- --- ---Sample Date 06 Apr 2022 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1122 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 44.7 --- --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.46 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 3.09 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 6 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 11 --- --- ---Copper ppm 13 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 85 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 5 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 462 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 351 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 12 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0142 [WUSCAR] 05515400 (Generated: 08/05/2023 13:47:00) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM STRIGLE - VOLVO0142
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC250EL 314145\Hydraulic System [VCP359463] 06 Apr 2022 @ 1121.8 hrs

