
[[IAA]] VOLVO L90H 624427 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VKC0000305
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: IAA

GW VAN KEPPEL CO1801 NORTH 9TH STKANSAS CITY, KSUS  66110Contact: PAT SAUSEpsause@vankeppel.comT: F: (913)281-4815
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a moderateamount of silt (particulates < 14microns in size) present in the oil. TheAN level is acceptable for this fluid.The condition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: GWVKANUnique No: 9947293Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 26 Apr 2022
Report Id: GWVKAN [WUSCAR] 05528013 (Generated: 02/28/2024 17:25:07) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PAT SAUSE - GWVKAN

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VKC0000305 VKC001882 --- ---Sample Date 04 Apr 2022 20 Mar 2019 --- ---Machine Hours 8003 2095 --- ---Oil Hours 2000 2000 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status ATTENTION NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 40.9 41.64 --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.28 0.362 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Particles >4µm 8639 2536 --- ---Particles >6µm 2232 84 --- ---Particles >14µm 131 5 --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 20/18/14 19/14/10 --- ---Silicon ppm 3 1 --- ---Sodium ppm 3 2 --- ---Potassium ppm 0 8 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 3 4 --- ---Copper ppm 2 4 --- ---Lead ppm <1 2 --- ---Tin ppm <1 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 <1 --- ---Chromium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 0 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 <1 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 0 --- ---Silver ppm <1 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 0 0 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 527 53 --- ---Magnesium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Zinc ppm 512 432 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 468 325 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 16 0 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: GWVKAN [WUSCAR] 05528013 (Generated: 02/28/2024 17:25:09) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PAT SAUSE - GWVKAN
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 624427\Hydraulic System [VKC0000305] 04 Apr 2022 @ 8003.0 hrs

