
[[SW1003910 GILA CONC]] VOLVO EC200EL 314540 - REAR LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP353841
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 80W90
Job No: SW1003910 GILA CONC

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY4323 EAST WINSLOW AVENUEPHOENIX, AZUS  85040Contact: RANDY PRZEKURATrandyp@arnoldmachinery.comT: F: (602)414-1904
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.Gear wear is indicated. Allother metal levels are typical for anew component breaking in. There isno indication of any contamination inthe oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO6174Unique No: 10010333Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 13 Jun 2022
Report Id: VOLVO6174 [WUSCAR] 05565933 (Generated: 11/27/2023 10:40:27) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY PRZEKURAT - VOLVO6174

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP353841 --- --- ---Sample Date 03 Jun 2022 --- --- ---Machine Hours 590 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 162 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 16 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 955 --- --- ---Copper ppm 1 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 12 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 2 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 13 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 7 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 1 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 19 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 281 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 1 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO6174 [WUSCAR] 05565933 (Generated: 11/27/2023 10:40:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY PRZEKURAT - VOLVO6174
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC200EL 314540\Rear Left Final Drive [VCP353841] 03 Jun 2022 @ 590.0 hrs

