
VOLVO A45G 352632 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP379074
Oil Type: DEXRON III
Job No:

A J MCDIRTTP.O. BOX 781STERLING, ILUS  61081Contact: SERVICE MANAGER
T: (815)631-1606F: 
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.Moderate concentration ofvisible metal present. All componentwear rates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe fluid. The condition of the fluid isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: AJMSTEUnique No: 10049876Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 15 Jul 2022
Report Id: AJMSTE [WUSCAR] 05590429 (Generated: 06/20/2024 11:59:35) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER - AJMSTE

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP379074 VCP349123 --- ---Sample Date 30 Jun 2022 30 Dec 2021 --- ---Machine Hours 1092 506 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Not Changd --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 29.0 28.9 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 16 14 --- ---Sodium ppm 5 5 --- ---Potassium ppm 4 3 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 48 28 --- ---Copper ppm 42 25 --- ---Lead ppm 0 0 --- ---Tin ppm 6 3 --- ---Aluminum ppm 24 12 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm 6 3 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 2 --- ---Manganese ppm 7 4 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 83 73 --- ---Magnesium ppm 1 2 --- ---Zinc ppm 6 5 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 212 185 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 74 82 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: AJMSTE [WUSCAR] 05590429 (Generated: 06/20/2024 11:59:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER - AJMSTE
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 352632\Transmission (Auto) [VCP379074] 30 Jun 2022 @ 1092.0 hrs

