
SENNEBOGEN 830M 830.0.2862 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP0002998
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No:

COMMERCIAL METALS COMPANY410 ATANDO AVECHARLOTTE, NCUS  28206Contact: JOHN PELOSOjohn.peloso@cmc.comT: (813)613-5034F: 
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Bearingand/or bushing wear is indicated. Allother component wear rates arenormal. There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: COMCHAVCUnique No: 10072608Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 30 Jul 2022
Report Id: COMCHAVC [WUSCAR] 05603127 (Generated: 06/30/2023 11:12:24) Rev: 1 Submitted By: CHRISTOPHER CANIPE

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP0002998 --- --- ---Sample Date 26 Jul 2022 --- --- ---Machine Hours 3997 --- --- ---Oil Hours 3997 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 186 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 3 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 32 --- --- ---Copper ppm 62 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 6 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 0 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 39 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1067 --- --- ---Barium ppm 357 --- --- ---Boron ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: COMCHAVC [WUSCAR] 05603127 (Generated: 06/30/2023 11:12:29) Rev: 1 Submitted By: CHRISTOPHER CANIPE
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGEN SENNEBOGEN 830M 830.0.2862\Front Axle [VCP0002998] 26 Jul 2022 @ 3997.0 hrs

