
SENNEBOGEN 830 830.0.1477 - TRANSMISSION

Sample No: VCP0002985
Oil Type: VOLVO VDS-4.5 Premium Motor Oil 15W40
Job No:

COMMERCIAL METALS COMPANY410 ATANDO AVECHARLOTTE, NCUS  28206Contact: JOHN PELOSOjohn.peloso@cmc.comT: (813)613-5034F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. The fluidchange at the time of sampling hasbeen noted. We recommend youservice the filters on this componentif applicable. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.Clutch and/orbushing/bearing wear is indicated.There is a moderate amount of visiblesilt present in the sample. Moderateconcentration of visible dirt/debrispresent in the fluid. There is amoderate concentration of waterpresent in the fluid. The condition ofthe fluid is acceptable for the time inservice.

Depot: COMCHAVCUnique No: 10072682Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 30 Jul 2022
Report Id: COMCHAVC [WUSCAR] 05603201 (Generated: 06/30/2023 11:00:32) Rev: 1 Submitted By: CHRISTOPHER CANIPE

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP0002985 --- --- ---Sample Date 26 Jul 2022 --- --- ---Machine Hours 12056 --- --- ---Oil Hours 12056 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.6 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.549 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 5 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 43 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 67 --- --- ---Copper ppm 250 --- --- ---Lead ppm 4 --- --- ---Tin ppm 2 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 16 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2265 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 168 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1378 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1261 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 3 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: COMCHAVC [WUSCAR] 05603201 (Generated: 06/30/2023 11:00:34) Rev: 1 Submitted By: CHRISTOPHER CANIPE
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGEN SENNEBOGEN 830 830.0.1477\Transmission [VCP0002985] 26 Jul 2022 @ 12056.0 hrs

