
[[A08851]] VOLVO A30G 740076 - WET DISC BRAKE

Sample No: VCP363733
Oil Type: MOBIL WB 102
Job No: A08851

K C CONSTRUCTION1737 STOUT DRIVEIVYLAND, PAUS  18974Contact: DUKE D.duked@kcconstruct.comT: (267)784-7337F:  x:
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.The copper level isabnormal. All other component wearrates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: KCCIVYUnique No: 10141972Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 23 Sep 2022
Report Id: KCCIVY [WUSCAR] 05647433 (Generated: 07/20/2023 12:10:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DUKE D. - KCCIVY

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP363733 VCP287944 VCP228848 VCP194166Sample Date 18 Sep 2022 29 Oct 2020 28 Jun 2018 01 Aug 2017Machine Hours 5485 4280 2760 2170Oil Hours 1000 4000 2760 2170Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 43.9 49.7 50.00 49.85
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 21 31 38 39Sodium ppm 4 3 4 4Potassium ppm 0 0 3 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 19 24 26 23Copper ppm 341 339 271 306Lead ppm 4 0 2 <1Tin ppm 0 0 0 2Aluminum ppm 2 2 2 1Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm <1 0 0 0Nickel ppm <1 2 1 <1Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 0Silver ppm 0 <1 0 0Manganese ppm 1 1 1 1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3353 3395 3174 3252Magnesium ppm 14 9 8 5Zinc ppm 1356 1305 1360 1310Phosphorus ppm 1128 1140 1117 1101Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 86 73 78 86

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: KCCIVY [WUSCAR] 05647433 (Generated: 07/20/2023 12:10:16) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DUKE D. - KCCIVY
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A30G 740076\Wet Disc Brake [VCP363733] 18 Sep 2022 @ 5485.0 hrs

