
[[SW1008724 YAVAPI]] VOLVO L70H 623687 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP353726
Oil Type: VOLVO COOLANT (GREEN)
Job No: SW1008724 YAVAPI

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY4323 EAST WINSLOW AVENUEPHOENIX, AZUS  85040Contact: RANDY PRZEKURATrandyp@arnoldmachinery.comT: F: (602)414-1904
Diagnosis
The fluid is suitable for furtherservice. There is no indication of anycontamination in the coolant. Glycoland nitrite levels are acceptable. ThepH level of this fluid is within theacceptable limits.

Depot: VOLVO6174Unique No: 10151581Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 30 Sep 2022
Report Id: VOLVO6174 [WUSCAR] 05652029 (Generated: 08/09/2023 12:47:11) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY PRZEKURAT - VOLVO6174

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP353726 --- --- ---Sample Date 16 Sep 2022 --- --- ---Machine Hours 7501 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 8.26 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 1012 --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 57.0 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -52 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance normal --- --- ---Coolant Color Orange --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO6174 [WUSCAR] 05652029 (Generated: 08/09/2023 12:47:13) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY PRZEKURAT - VOLVO6174
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L70H 623687\Coolant [VCP353726] 16 Sep 2022 @ 7501.0 hrs

