
[[PM504001612]] VOLVO EC250EL 314031 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP330883
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: PM504001612

ACTIVE RECYCLING CO INC2000 W SLAUSON AVELOS ANGELES, CAUS  90047Contact: SERVICE MANAGER
T: (323)295-7774F: 
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor. We wereunable to perform a particle countdue to a high concentration ofparticles present in this sample.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Moderate concentration of visibledirt/debris present in the oil. The ANlevel is acceptable for this fluid. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: ACTLOSUnique No: 10163568Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 07 Oct 2022
Report Id: ACTLOS [WUSCAR] 05658999 (Generated: 01/05/2024 10:27:46) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER ? - ACTLOS

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP330883 VCP281440 --- ---Sample Date 29 Sep 2022 04 Aug 2020 --- ---Machine Hours 3704 1111 --- ---Oil Hours 0 1000 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Not Changd --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 47.3 49.1 --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.48 0.679 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Particles >4µm --- 99905 --- ---Particles >6µm --- 40067 --- ---Particles >14µm --- 5096 --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) --- 24/23/20 --- ---Silicon ppm 5 3 --- ---Sodium ppm 1 2 --- ---Potassium ppm 2 <1 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 9 2 --- ---Copper ppm 12 4 --- ---Lead ppm 0 <1 --- ---Tin ppm 0 <1 --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 <1 --- ---Chromium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 0 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 0 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 0 --- ---Silver ppm <1 0 --- ---Manganese ppm <1 <1 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 126 88 --- ---Magnesium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Zinc ppm 416 565 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 348 464 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm <1 <1 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: ACTLOS [WUSCAR] 05658999 (Generated: 01/05/2024 10:27:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER ? - ACTLOS
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC250EL 314031\Hydraulic System [VCP330883] 29 Sep 2022 @ 3704.0 hrs

