
[[PM504001612]] VOLVO EC250EL 314031 - FRONT LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP353820
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90 GL-5
Job No: PM504001612

ACTIVE RECYCLING CO INC2000 W SLAUSON AVELOS ANGELES, CAUS  90047Contact: SERVICE MANAGER
T: (323)295-7774F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: ACTLOSUnique No: 10163769Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 06 Oct 2022
Report Id: ACTLOS [WUSCAR] 05659200 (Generated: 01/05/2024 10:27:59) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER ? - ACTLOS

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP353820 VCP281443 --- ---Sample Date 28 Sep 2022 04 Aug 2020 --- ---Machine Hours 3704 1111 --- ---Oil Hours 0 500 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 145 174 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 6 15 --- ---Sodium ppm 0 2 --- ---Potassium ppm 0 2 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 100 123 --- ---Copper ppm <1 <1 --- ---Lead ppm 0 <1 --- ---Tin ppm <1 <1 --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 0 --- ---Chromium ppm 2 2 --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 0 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 <1 --- ---Manganese ppm 1 3 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 5 11 --- ---Magnesium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Zinc ppm 12 6 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 913 460 --- ---Barium ppm 0 4 --- ---Boron ppm 133 2 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: ACTLOS [WUSCAR] 05659200 (Generated: 01/05/2024 10:28:03) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER ? - ACTLOS
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC250EL 314031\Front Left Final Drive [VCP353820] 28 Sep 2022 @ 3704.0 hrs

