
[[SWA092698 GOLF RENT]] VOLVO L30GS 3220275 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP386713
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 85W90
Job No: SWA092698 GOLF RENT

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY5151 DR MARTIN LUTHER KING BLVDFORT MYERS, FLUS  33905Contact: TODD LARKtlark@altaequipfl.comT: F: (239)481-3302
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. The oil changeat the time of sampling has beennoted. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. Appearance is milky.There is a high concentration ofwater present in the oil. The oil is nolonger serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: VOLVO0090Unique No: 10206270Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 09 Nov 2022
Report Id: VOLVO0090 [WUSCAR] 05686698 (Generated: 08/15/2023 08:37:06) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TODD LARK - VOLVO0090

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP386713 VCP312528 --- ---Sample Date 01 Nov 2022 28 Dec 2021 --- ---Machine Hours 5081 4221 --- ---Oil Hours 5081 4221 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status SEVERE SEVERE --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 216 179 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 5.06 5.74 --- ---Silicon ppm 8 11 --- ---Sodium ppm 0 9 --- ---Potassium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 133 219 --- ---Copper ppm <1 <1 --- ---Lead ppm <1 <1 --- ---Tin ppm 2 <1 --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 2 --- ---Chromium ppm 2 3 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 3 1 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 1 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 3 4 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 69 52 --- ---Magnesium ppm 19 10 --- ---Zinc ppm 66 54 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1156 1362 --- ---Barium ppm <1 0 --- ---Boron ppm 174 244 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0090 [WUSCAR] 05686698 (Generated: 08/15/2023 08:37:09) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TODD LARK - VOLVO0090
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L30GS 3220275\Front Axle [VCP386713] 01 Nov 2022 @ 5081.0 hrs

