
[[A09192]] VOLVO A30G 740078 - WET DISC BRAKE

Sample No: VCP365707
Oil Type: MOBIL WB 102
Job No: A09192

K C CONSTRUCTION1737 STOUT DRIVEIVYLAND, PAUS  18974Contact: DUKE D.duked@kcconstruct.comT: (267)784-7337F:  x:
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Thecopper level is abnormal. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.Moderate concentration of visibledirt/debris present in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: KCCIVYUnique No: 10227333Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 20 Nov 2022
Report Id: KCCIVY [WUSCAR] 05697759 (Generated: 07/20/2023 12:10:21) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DUKE D. - KCCIVY

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP365707 VCP288986 --- ---Sample Date 10 Nov 2022 04 Nov 2020 --- ---Machine Hours 4945 3630 --- ---Oil Hours 1000 3630 --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd Changed --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 44.5 47.5 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 16 20 --- ---Sodium ppm 4 <1 --- ---Potassium ppm 0 <1 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 17 20 --- ---Copper ppm 187 227 --- ---Lead ppm 3 <1 --- ---Tin ppm <1 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 0 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm <1 <1 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 <1 --- ---Manganese ppm <1 <1 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 <1 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2972 3001 --- ---Magnesium ppm 15 10 --- ---Zinc ppm 1297 1182 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1026 1099 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 81 77 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: KCCIVY [WUSCAR] 05697759 (Generated: 07/20/2023 12:10:24) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DUKE D. - KCCIVY
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A30G 740078\Wet Disc Brake [VCP365707] 10 Nov 2022 @ 4945.0 hrs

