
[[A09082]] VOLVO A40G 341662 - BOGIE/CENTER AXLE

Sample No: VCP384280
Oil Type: MOBIL GO 102
Job No: A09082

K C CONSTRUCTION1737 STOUT DRIVEIVYLAND, PAUS  18974Contact: DUKE D.duked@kcconstruct.comT: (267)784-7337F:  x:
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.Gear wear is indicated. Allother component wear rates arenormal. There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The oilviscosity is lower than normal.Confirm oil type.

Depot: KCCIVYUnique No: 10227334Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 20 Nov 2022
Report Id: KCCIVY [WUSCAR] 05697760 (Generated: 07/20/2023 10:12:15) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DUKE D. - KCCIVY

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP384280 VCP278593 --- ---Sample Date 09 Nov 2022 09 Aug 2021 --- ---Machine Hours 6440 5380 --- ---Oil Hours 2000 1000 --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ATTENTION --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 55.8 52.1 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 8 3 --- ---Sodium ppm 5 4 --- ---Potassium ppm <1 1 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 1024 368 --- ---Copper ppm 7 5 --- ---Lead ppm <1 <1 --- ---Tin ppm 0 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 0 --- ---Chromium ppm 13 4 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 15 4 --- ---Nickel ppm 4 2 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 <1 --- ---Manganese ppm 24 10 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 57 78 --- ---Magnesium ppm 2 1 --- ---Zinc ppm 31 43 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 2304 2191 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 180 194 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: KCCIVY [WUSCAR] 05697760 (Generated: 07/20/2023 10:12:18) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DUKE D. - KCCIVY
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 341662\Bogie/Center Axle [VCP384280] 09 Nov 2022 @ 6440.0 hrs

