
[[125204]] VOLVO A40G 342574 - WET DISC BRAKE

Sample No: VCP370129
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: 125204

ALTA EQUIPMENT5985 COURT STREET ROADSYRACUSE, NYUS  13206Contact: JIM STRIGLEJIM.STRIGLE@ALTG.COMT: (315)437-2611F: (315)434-9471
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0142Unique No: 10255044Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 14 Dec 2022
Report Id: VOLVO0142 [WUSCAR] 05715468 (Generated: 05/08/2024 14:33:25) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM STRIGLE - VOLVO0142

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP370129 VCP327684 VCP305226 VCP262516Sample Date 06 Dec 2022 24 Sep 2021 25 Feb 2021 23 Mar 2020Machine Hours 5696 4288 3528 1950Oil Hours 0 2288 500 1950Oil Changed N/A Changed Not Changd ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.4 41.0 43.5 39.9
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 18 11 12 20Sodium ppm 5 7 3 7Potassium ppm 0 0 1 1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 27 16 19 16Copper ppm 112 168 124 146Lead ppm <1 0 <1 0Tin ppm <1 <1 0 <1Aluminum ppm 2 <1 <1 <1Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 1 2 2 0Nickel ppm <1 3 3 5Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 0Silver ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 4211 3514 3671 3800Magnesium ppm 26 28 33 10Zinc ppm 1552 1409 1438 1463Phosphorus ppm 1264 1202 1248 1269Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 146 134 126 107

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0142 [WUSCAR] 05715468 (Generated: 05/08/2024 14:33:28) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM STRIGLE - VOLVO0142
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 342574\Wet Disc Brake [VCP370129] 06 Dec 2022 @ 5696.0 hrs

