
[[125204]] VOLVO A40G 342574 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP368110
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90 GL-5
Job No: 125204

ALTA EQUIPMENT5985 COURT STREET ROADSYRACUSE, NYUS  13206Contact: JIM STRIGLEJIM.STRIGLE@ALTG.COMT: (315)437-2611F: (315)434-9471
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Moderate concentration of visibledirt/debris present in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0142Unique No: 10255045Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 14 Dec 2022
Report Id: VOLVO0142 [WUSCAR] 05715469 (Generated: 05/08/2024 14:33:41) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM STRIGLE - VOLVO0142

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP368110 VCP327681 VCP305219 VCP280324Sample Date 06 Dec 2022 24 Sep 2021 25 Feb 2021 13 Oct 2020Machine Hours 5696 4288 3528 2953Oil Hours 0 0 500 1000Oil Changed N/A Changed Not Changd ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 138 144 117 240
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 4 0 10 3Sodium ppm 0 1 3 0Potassium ppm 0 0 <1 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 48 24 54 31Copper ppm 0 <1 3 <1Lead ppm 0 0 <1 0Tin ppm 0 <1 0 0Aluminum ppm <1 0 31 0Chromium ppm <1 <1 2 <1Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 13 <1Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 <1Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 <1 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 2 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 19 23 60 41Magnesium ppm 0 0 <1 <1Zinc ppm 9 3 28 8Phosphorus ppm 1041 978 1222 929Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 220 246 192 192

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0142 [WUSCAR] 05715469 (Generated: 05/08/2024 14:33:44) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM STRIGLE - VOLVO0142
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 342574\Front Axle [VCP368110] 06 Dec 2022 @ 5696.0 hrs

